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ABSTRACT 
Case report : To the best of our knowledge this could be the first report of a successfully performed 

laparoscopic surgery for female patient having had multiple  liver hydatid cysts ( 7 in number) in both lobes of 

liver. 

Background: Laparoscopic hydatid surgery ( LHS) was almost gaining acceptance all over the world. But 

still there are contraindications to this approach of particular are those with multiple cysts ( >3 cysts)
1
.On 

reviewing the literature most of the reports of LHS were for patients with solitary hydatid cyst and  

exceptionally for a maximum of  three cysts. Herein an initial effort to expand the application of  LHS in 

managing multiple hydatid cysts of  liver (>3)  with all the advantages of laparoscopic approach; less pain, 

good cosmetic results, rapid recovery and less complications. 
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(  اسكيأ 7) بذكال يف متعذدة تيمائ اسكيا لرفع ناجحت تيعمل

 حالت ريتقر :ي الجراح بالمنظار

 
 حسن ابزاهيم سميز

 انعزاق ، انموصم ، انموصم جامعت ، انطب كهيت ، انجزاحت فزع

 

 الخلاصت

تنفذ بنجاح عهى مزيضت تعاني من حانت اكياس مائيت متعددة في  ناظوريهحسب انمعهوماث انمتوفزة ندينا هذا اول تقزيز نجزاحت 

 . (7كلا فصي انكبد )عدد 

 

 . بدكان،  تياس مائكيأ،  منظار :الكلماث المفتاحيت 

 

INTRODUCTION 
chinococcosis is the most frequent cause of 
liver cysts in the world 

1,2
 . Hydatid disease is 

endemic mainly in the Mediternnean countries, the 
Middle East,  South America, India, and northern 
China

3
. Liver echinococosis is endemic in our 

country and still it represent a disease that can be 
challenging for the surgeon

4
.  It is caused by 

parasite called Echinococcus Granulosis that 
inhabit the intestine of dogs and canines as a 
definitive host. Humans are accidental intermediate 
hosts due to ingestion of the parasitic eggs

5
 . The 

most common sites are the liver account for 
60% ,the lung account for30% although it may 
develop at other sites including kidney,bone,brain 
and heart

 6
. 

Surgery remains the treatment of choice for the 
majority of cases of Hydatid liver cyst despite 
significant economic costs, advances in medical 
treatment, and interventional radiology

  6-9
 .The 

main principle in any hydatid cyst surgery is to 
eliminate the scolices by evacuation without 
spillage, to check for any biliary communication, to 
sterilize and to obliterate the residual cavity 

7
. 

E 
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Laparoscopic approach follow the same rules as 
in conventional surgery. In spite of  advancement 
in the laparoscopic techniques but still there are 
contraindications to LHS like; those with intra-
parenchymal cysts, cysts at risky site (e.g.  near 
the porta hepatis), complicated cysts, and multiple 
cysts (>3) which are not candidates for 
laparoscopic approach 
 

The Case 
 A female 45 years old female housewife 

resident in Mosul, presented with long history of 
upper abdominal discomfort. She gave no history 
of fever, jaundice. Her appetite was good with 
normal bowel motion. There was no history of loss 
of weight. There was no clear history of animal 
contact. On examination, she looked healthy, And 
she had neither anaemia nor jaundice. Her 
abdomen was of normal contour, soft, with 
palpable liver.  Ultrasound examination of 
abdomen showed the presence of multiple cystic 
lesions in both lobes of liver, more than 3 in 
number. For more confirmation of the diagnosis 
and also for more accurate number and 
localization of the cysts a computerized 
tomography was ordered. CT scan revealed the 
presence of multiple hypodense lesions in both 
lobes of liver, of variable sizes; the largest one was   
7 cm in diameter. The cysts were distributed in 
both lobes of liver particularly in segments 
2,4,6,and 8, Figure 1. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Figure 1: CT scan of abdomen revealed multiple 
hypodense cystic lesions in both lobes of liver. 

 
Serological investigations for hydatid disease was 

not done because of its unavailability in our 
locality. The patient given a chance of medical 
therapy and Albendazol 200mg t.i.d. was given for 
three months. At the end of this period MRI 
examination of abdomen was done and revealed 
more or less the same findings as that of the CT 
scan prior to therapy, Figure 2. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

Figure 2: MRI examination showing multiple cysts 
in liver 

 
More close view of MRI showed the characteristic 

picture of water lily sign which is pathognomonic of 
hydatid cyst with detached laminated membrane, 
Figure 3. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Figure 3: MRI examination showing  water lily 
appearance. 

 
A decision for surgical treatment was discussed 

with the patient and an informed consent was 
taken for laparoscopic management. Chest X ray 
showed no  concomitant pulmonary hydatid, Figure 
4. 
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Figure 4 : Chest X ray revealed  clear lungs 
 

Operative Procedure 
The operation conducted under general 

anaesthesia and muscle relaxation. Open 
laparoscopy performed through the umbilical 
cicatrix and pneumoinsufflation started through the 
10mm cannula. Initial exploratory laparoscopy 
done and the 7 cysts of liver were seen distributed 
in both lobes of liver, Figure 5. 

 

 

 
Figure  5, Operative view of the cysts on the liver 

 

All the cysts were manipulated like in 
conventional open surgery; initial aspiration of 
cysts and injection of scolicidal agent (Povidone 
iodine 10%), with great care taken to prevent 
spillage by using suction guard near the aspiration 
needle, figure 6. 

 

 
Figure 6 , (A)Needle aspiration with suction 

guard ,(B) Aspirated cystic fluid 
 
The ectocyst was opened and the contents 

sucked out. The cysts were found to be dead 
probably as an effect of Albendazol, as they were 
not tense, with opalescent fluid, and macerated 
laminated membrane. The laminated membrane   
of all cysts were taken out by suction. Checking of 
residual cavities was performed by intracavitory 
telescope looking for any billiaray communication 
or missed cyst contents. Two tube drains were put 
in the right and left subphrenic spaces. On the 2

nd
 

postoperative day the patient was healthy, and 
started oral intake. Ultrasound examination was 
performed in the fifth postoperative day and 
revealed  no collections, so the drains were 
removed and the patients discharged home. The 
patient was seen one week later , having no 
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complaints, with clean wounds, Figure 7. The 
patient was continued on albendazol 200mg t.i.d. 
for one month. The patient was followed for 3 
months, having no complaints and monthly 
ultrasound examinations revealed no collections.   
 

 
Figure 7 :  Clean Port wounds 7 days after surgery 
 

Comment 
In our locality till now the majority of the hydatid 

cysts of the liver have been managed by 
conventional open surgical techniques. LHS was 
introduced  since the beginning of this century, 
applied  for certain selected patients with promising 
initial results

6
. The same principles of conventional 

liver hydatid cyst surgery, including inactivation of 
scolices, prevention of spillage, elimination of 
viable elements of the cyst, and management of 
the residual cavity were applied in the laparoscopic 
approach . As elsewhere LHD has its own 
limitations and in particular those with multiple 
cysts (>3 cysts), which were not operated upon 
laparoscopically

1,10
.  

LHS was introduced in our locality since 2000. 
After standardization of the technique  and 
accepting  good experience in this mode of 
surgery, we started to apply  LHD more widely and 
patients with 2-3 cysts were operated upon with 
good results. 
The outcome of surgery was excellent with no 

morbidity during the follow up period. The 
patient was followed for up to one year after 
surgery having no any complaints and ultrasound 
checking  was done on each visit with no evidence 
of recurrence of the cyst. 
This successful procedure may open the window 

for more wider application of laparoscopy in  the 
management of hydatid disease of liver.   
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